Bid Comparison Form:

Job/Sub Job: Project: Completed By: Date:
J07415.000 2017 Antioch School District 34 Referendum Facility Master Plan Chris Urban 2/13/2018
Bid Package No./Rel. Description of Package:
BP02A Demolition Work Page 1 of 1
Firms Submitting Bids
1 Alpine Demolition Services 3
2 Johler Demolition 4
Bid Details 1 2 3 4 6
0, H .
10 % Bid Bond: X X
Supplements 1, 2, 3, 4,5
X X
BASE BID $651,240 $487,925
Alternates:
Alt 1 - OA Replace Existing Windows $28,800 $21,500
Alt 2 - OA Added Site Lighting
Alt 3 - WC Skylights in LRC 145/145A
Alt 4 - WC New Generator
Alt 5 - BOTH Resilient Athletic Flooring
Alt 6 - OA Delete Ext Gym Windows
Alt 7 - OA Delete Int Gym Windows
Alt 8a - OA Backfill and Pad w/ Stone
Alt 8b - WC Backfill and Pad w/ Stone
Alt 9 - BOTH Delete 50% Operables
Alt 10 - BOTH Logos on Gym Walls
Alt 11 - BOTH Logos on Gym Floors
Alt 12 - WC Alum Ext Door at C3 $1,130 $250
Alt 13 - WC Rem/Replace Admin Slab $4,250 $0

Alt 14 - OA Increase UV Louver Size

Alt 15a - OA Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 15b - OA Temp Siemens

Alt 15c - OA Temp Carrier

Alt 15d - OA Temp Automated Logic

Alt 15e - OA Temp Honeywell

Alt 15f - OA Temp Belimo

Alt 16a - WC Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 16b - WC Temp Siemens

Alt 16c - WC Temp Carrier

Alt 16d - WC Temp Automated Logic

Alt 16e - WC Temp Honeywell

Alt 16f - WC Temp Belimo




Bid Comparison Form:

Job/Sub Job: Project: Completed By: Date:
J07415.000 2017 Antioch School District 34 Referendum Facility Master Plan Chris Urban 2/13/2018
Bid Package No./Rel. Description of Package:
BPO3A Building Concrete Work - Oakland Page 1 of 1
Firms Submitting Bids
1 Abbey Paving & Sealcoating Co. 3 Eagle Concrete Manusos General Contracting
2 Boller Construction 4 Joseph J Henderson
Bid Details 1 2 3 4 5 6
10 % Bid Bond: X X X X
Supplements 1, 2, 3, 4,5
X X X X X
BASE BID $698,345 $796,500 $791,650 $806,000 $834,000
Alternates:
Alt 1 - OA Replace Existing Windows
Alt 2 - OA Added Site Lighting
Alt 3 - WC Skylights in LRC 145/145A
Alt 4 - WC New Generator
Alt 5 - BOTH Resilient Athletic Flooring $0 ($2,500) $0 $0 ($1,675)

Alt 6 - OA Delete Ext Gym Windows

Alt 7 - OA Delete Int Gym Windows

Alt 8a - OA Backfill and Pad w/ Stone

Alt 8b - WC Backfill and Pad w/ Stone

Alt 9 - BOTH Delete 50% Operables

Alt 10 - BOTH Logos on Gym Walls

Alt 11 - BOTH Logos on Gym Floors

Alt 12 - WC Alum Ext Door at C3

Alt 13 - WC Rem/Replace Admin Slab

Alt 14 - OA Increase UV Louver Size

Alt 15a - OA Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 15b - OA Temp Siemens

Alt 15¢c - OA Temp Carrier

Alt 15d - OA Temp Automated Logic

Alt 15e - OA Temp Honeywell

Alt 15f - OA Temp Belimo

Alt 16a - WC Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 16b - WC Temp Siemens

Alt 16c - WC Temp Carrier

Alt 16d - WC Temp Automated Logic

Alt 16e - WC Temp Honeywell

Alt 16f - WC Temp Belimo




Bid Comparison Form:

Job/Sub Job: Project:
J07415.000

2017 Antioch School District 34 Referendum Facility Master Plan

Bid Package No./Rel. Description of Package:

BP03B Building Concrete Work - W.C. Petty

Completed By:
Chris Urban

Date:
2/13/2018

Firms Submitting Bids

1 Abbey Paving & Sealcoating Co.

2 Boller Construction

3 Eagle Concrete

4 Joseph J Henderson

Page 1 of 1

Manusos General Contracting

Bid Details 1

10 % Bid Bond:

Supplements 1, 2, 3, 4,5
X

X X

X

X

BASE BID $416,723

$499,500

$492,600

$498,000

$506,000

Alternates:

Alt 1 - OA Replace Existing Windows

Alt 2 - OA Added Site Lighting

Alt 3 - WC Skylights in LRC 145/145A

Alt 4 - WC New Generator

$1,500

Alt 5 - BOTH Resilient Athletic Flooring $0

($2,500) $0

$0

($1,675)

Alt 6 - OA Delete Ext Gym Windows

Alt 7 - OA Delete Int Gym Windows

Alt 8a - OA Backfill and Pad w/ Stone

Alt 8b - WC Backfill and Pad w/ Stone

Alt 9 - BOTH Delete 50% Operables

Alt 10 - BOTH Logos on Gym Walls

Alt 11 - BOTH Logos on Gym Floors

Alt 12 - WC Alum Ext Door at C3

Alt 13 - WC Rem/Replace Admin Slab $10,500

$12,000 ($5,000)

$19,500

$28,500

Alt 14 - OA Increase UV Louver Size

Alt 15a - OA Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 15b - OA Temp Siemens

Alt 15c - OA Temp Carrier

Alt 15d - OA Temp Automated Logic

Alt 15e - OA Temp Honeywell

Alt 15f - OA Temp Belimo

Alt 16a - WC Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 16b - WC Temp Siemens

Alt 16c - WC Temp Carrier

Alt 16d - WC Temp Automated Logic

Alt 16e - WC Temp Honeywell

Alt 16f - WC Temp Belimo




Bid Comparison Form:

Job/Sub Job: Project: Completed By: Date:
J07415.000 2017 Antioch School District 34 Referendum Facility Master Plan Chris Urban 2/13/2018
Bid Package No./Rel. Description of Package:
BP0O3C Precast Concrete Work Page 1 of 1
Firms Submitting Bids
1 ATMI Precast 3
2 lllini Precast 4
Bid Details 1 2 3 4 6
10 % Bid Bond: X X
Supplements 1, 2, 3, 4,5
X only 1

BASE BID $1,586,000 $1,010,712
Alternates:

Alt 1 - OA Replace Existing Windows

Alt 2 - OA Added Site Lighting

Alt 3 - WC Skylights in LRC 145/145A

Alt 4 - WC New Generator

Alt 5 - BOTH Resilient Athletic Flooring

Alt 6 - OA Delete Ext Gym Windows

Alt 7 - OA Delete Int Gym Windows

Alt 8a - OA Backfill and Pad w/ Stone

Alt 8b - WC Backfill and Pad w/ Stone

Alt 9 - BOTH Delete 50% Operables

Alt 10 - BOTH Logos on Gym Walls

Alt 11 - BOTH Logos on Gym Floors

Alt 12 - WC Alum Ext Door at C3

Alt 13 - WC Rem/Replace Admin Slab

Alt 14 - OA Increase UV Louver Size

Alt 15a - OA Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 15b - OA Temp Siemens

Alt 15c - OA Temp Carrier

Alt 15d - OA Temp Automated Logic

Alt 15e - OA Temp Honeywell

Alt 15f - OA Temp Belimo

Alt 16a - WC Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 16b - WC Temp Siemens

Alt 16c - WC Temp Carrier

Alt 16d - WC Temp Automated Logic

Alt 16e - WC Temp Honeywell

Alt 16f - WC Temp Belimo




Bid Comparison Form:

Job/Sub Job:
J07415.000

Bid Package No./Rel.
BP0O4A

Project:

2017 Antioch School District 34 Referendum Facility Master Plan

1 A. Horn

Description of Package:
Masonry Work

Completed By:
Chris Urban

Date:
2/13/2018

Firms Submitting Bids

Jimmy'Z Masonry Corp.

2 JAC Masonry

MPZ Masonry

Page 1 of 1

Rasco Mason Contractors

Bid Details

10 % Bid Bond:

Supplements 1, 2, 3, 4,5

X X

X

X

X

BASE BID

$835,100 $729,900

$924,800

$826,000

$798,500

Alternates:

Alt 1 - OA Replace Existing Windows

Alt 2 - OA Added Site Lighting

Alt 3 - WC Skylights in LRC 145/145A

Alt 4 - WC New Generator

Alt 5 - BOTH Resilient Athletic Flooring

Alt 6 - OA Delete Ext Gym Windows

Alt 7 - OA Delete Int Gym Windows

$2,325 $6,000

$1,900

$1,200

$1,200

Alt 8a - OA Backfill and Pad w/ Stone

Alt 8b - WC Backfill and Pad w/ Stone

Alt 9 - BOTH Delete 50% Operables

Alt 10 - BOTH Logos on Gym Walls

Alt 11 - BOTH Logos on Gym Floors

Alt 12 - WC Alum Ext Door at C3

Alt 13 - WC Rem/Replace Admin Slab

Alt 14 - OA Increase UV Louver Size

$21,200 $18,700

$17,500

$45,000

Alt 15a - OA Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 15b - OA Temp Siemens

Alt 15c - OA Temp Carrier

Alt 15d - OA Temp Automated Logic

Alt 15e - OA Temp Honeywell

Alt 15f - OA Temp Belimo

Alt 16a - WC Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 16b - WC Temp Siemens

Alt 16c - WC Temp Carrier

Alt 16d - WC Temp Automated Logic

Alt 16e - WC Temp Honeywell

Alt 16f - WC Temp Belimo




Bid Comparison Form:

Job/Sub Job:
J07415.000

Bid Package No./Rel.
BPO5A

Project:

2017 Antioch School District 34 Referendum Facility Master Plan

Description of Package:

Structural Steel and Misc. Metals - Oakland

Completed By:

Chris Urban

1 T.A. Bowman Constructors

Firms Submitting Bids

2 Waukegan Steel

Date:
2/13/2018

Page 1 of 1

Bid Details

10 % Bid Bond:

Supplements 1, 2, 3, 4,5

X

X

BASE BID

$597,700

$652,000

Alternates:

Alt 1 - OA Replace Existing Windows

Alt 2 - OA Added Site Lighting

Alt 3 - WC Skylights in LRC 145/145A

$18,000

Alt 4 - WC New Generator

Alt 5 - BOTH Resilient Athletic Flooring

Alt 6 - OA Delete Ext Gym Windows

Alt 7 - OA Delete Int Gym Windows

Alt 8a - OA Backfill and Pad w/ Stone

Alt 8b - WC Backfill and Pad w/ Stone

Alt 9 - BOTH Delete 50% Operables

Alt 10 - BOTH Logos on Gym Walls

Alt 11 - BOTH Logos on Gym Floors

Alt 12 - WC Alum Ext Door at C3

Alt 13 - WC Rem/Replace Admin Slab

Alt 14 - OA Increase UV Louver Size

$4,000

($3,000)

Alt 15a - OA Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 15b - OA Temp Siemens

Alt 15c - OA Temp Carrier

Alt 15d - OA Temp Automated Logic

Alt 15e - OA Temp Honeywell

Alt 15f - OA Temp Belimo

Alt 16a - WC Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 16b - WC Temp Siemens

Alt 16c - WC Temp Carrier

Alt 16d - WC Temp Automated Logic

Alt 16e - WC Temp Honeywell

Alt 16f - WC Temp Belimo




Bid Comparison Form:

Job/Sub Job:
J07415.000

Bid Package No./Rel.
BP05B

Project:

2017 Antioch School District 34 Referendum Facility Master Plan

Description of Package:

Structural Steel and Misc. Metals Work - W.C. Petty

Completed By:

Chris Urban

1 T.A. Bowman Constructors

Firms Submitting Bids

2 Waukegan Steel

Date:
2/13/2018

Page 1 of 1

Bid Details

10 % Bid Bond:

Supplements 1, 2, 3, 4,5

X

X

BASE BID

$403,500

$438,000

Alternates:

Alt 1 - OA Replace Existing Windows

Alt 2 - OA Added Site Lighting

Alt 3 - WC Skylights in LRC 145/145A

$18,000

$13,720

Alt 4 - WC New Generator

Alt 5 - BOTH Resilient Athletic Flooring

Alt 6 - OA Delete Ext Gym Windows

Alt 7 - OA Delete Int Gym Windows

Alt 8a - OA Backfill and Pad w/ Stone

Alt 8b - WC Backfill and Pad w/ Stone

Alt 9 - BOTH Delete 50% Operables

Alt 10 - BOTH Logos on Gym Walls

Alt 11 - BOTH Logos on Gym Floors

Alt 12 - WC Alum Ext Door at C3

Alt 13 - WC Rem/Replace Admin Slab

Alt 14 - OA Increase UV Louver Size

$4,000

Alt 15a - OA Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 15b - OA Temp Siemens

Alt 15c - OA Temp Carrier

Alt 15d - OA Temp Automated Logic

Alt 15e - OA Temp Honeywell

Alt 15f - OA Temp Belimo

Alt 16a - WC Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 16b - WC Temp Siemens

Alt 16c - WC Temp Carrier

Alt 16d - WC Temp Automated Logic

Alt 16e - WC Temp Honeywell

Alt 16f - WC Temp Belimo




Bid Comparison Form:

Job/Sub Job: Project: Completed By: Date:
J07415.000 2017 Antioch School District 34 Referendum Facility Master Plan Chris Urban 2/13/2018
Bid Package No./Rel. Description of Package:
BPO6A General Trades Work Page 1 of 1
Firms Submitting Bids
1 Boller Construction Company 3 Manusos General Contracting Stuckey Construction Co.
2 Doherty Construction 4 Shales McNutt LLC
Bid Details 1 2 3 4 5 6
10 % Bid Bond: X X X X
Supplements 1, 2, 3, 4,5
X X X X X
BASE BID $2,110,000 $2,378,000 $2,295,000 $2,197,000 $2,629,629
Alternates:
Alt 1 - OA Replace Existing Windows $8,500 $11,515 $11,060 $23,500
Alt 2 - OA Added Site Lighting
Alt 3 - WC Skylights in LRC 145/145A
Alt 4 - WC New Generator
Alt 5 - BOTH Resilient Athletic Flooring
Alt 6 - OA Delete Ext Gym Windows
Alt 7 - OA Delete Int Gym Windows ($5,000) ($65,700) ($1,375) ($67,550) ($67,500)
Alt 8a - OA Backfill and Pad w/ Stone
Alt 8b - WC Backfill and Pad w/ Stone
Alt 9 - BOTH Delete 50% Operables
Alt 10 - BOTH Logos on Gym Walls
Alt 11 - BOTH Logos on Gym Floors
Alt 12 - WC Alum Ext Door at C3 ($5,500) ($6,700) $6,375 ($4,080) ($6,500)

Alt 13 - WC Rem/Replace Admin Slab

Alt 14 - OA Increase UV Louver Size

Alt 15a - OA Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 15b - OA Temp Siemens

Alt 15c - OA Temp Carrier

Alt 15d - OA Temp Automated Logic

Alt 15e - OA Temp Honeywell

Alt 15f - OA Temp Belimo

Alt 16a - WC Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 16b - WC Temp Siemens

Alt 16c - WC Temp Carrier

Alt 16d - WC Temp Automated Logic

Alt 16e - WC Temp Honeywell

Alt 16f - WC Temp Belimo




Bid Comparison Form:

Job/Sub Job: Project: Completed By: Date:
J07415.000 2017 Antioch School District 34 Referendum Facility Master Plan Chris Urban 2/13/2018
Bid Package No./Rel. Description of Package:
BP06B Fiber Cement Panel Systems Work Page 1 of 1
Firms Submitting Bids
1 Boller Construction Company 3
2 Stuckey Construction Co. 4
Bid Details 1 2 3 4 6
10 % Bid Bond: X X
Supplements 1, 2, 3, 4,5
X X

BASE BID $1,181,700 $1,180,000
Alternates:

Alt 1 - OA Replace Existing Windows

Alt 2 - OA Added Site Lighting

Alt 3 - WC Skylights in LRC 145/145A

Alt 4 - WC New Generator

Alt 5 - BOTH Resilient Athletic Flooring

Alt 6 - OA Delete Ext Gym Windows

Alt 7 - OA Delete Int Gym Windows

Alt 8a - OA Backfill and Pad w/ Stone

Alt 8b - WC Backfill and Pad w/ Stone

Alt 9 - BOTH Delete 50% Operables

Alt 10 - BOTH Logos on Gym Walls

Alt 11 - BOTH Logos on Gym Floors

Alt 12 - WC Alum Ext Door at C3

Alt 13 - WC Rem/Replace Admin Slab

Alt 14 - OA Increase UV Louver Size

Alt 15a - OA Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 15b - OA Temp Siemens

Alt 15c - OA Temp Carrier

Alt 15d - OA Temp Automated Logic

Alt 15e - OA Temp Honeywell

Alt 15f - OA Temp Belimo

Alt 16a - WC Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 16b - WC Temp Siemens

Alt 16c - WC Temp Carrier

Alt 16d - WC Temp Automated Logic

Alt 16e - WC Temp Honeywell

Alt 16f - WC Temp Belimo




Bid Comparison Form:

Job/Sub Job: Project: Completed By: Date:
J07415.000 2017 Antioch School District 34 Referendum Facility Master Plan Chris Urban 2/13/2018
Bid Package No./Rel. Description of Package:
BPO7A Roofing Work Page 1 of 1
Firms Submitting Bids
1 A-1 Roofing Company 3 G.E. Riddiford Metalmaster Roofmaster
2 Bennett & Brosseau Roofing 4 L Marshall Roofing
Bid Details 1 2 3 4 5 6
10 % Bid Bond: X X X X
Supplements 1, 2, 3, 4,5
X thru 4 X X X

BASE BID $1,206,825 $1,307,500 $1,472,000 $1,583,100 $1,083,327
Alternates:
Alt 1 - OA Replace Existing Windows
Alt 2 - OA Added Site Lighting
Alt 3 - WC Skylights in LRC 145/145A $15,800 $15,000 $15,000 $21,200 $11,720

Alt 4 - WC New Generator

Alt 5 - BOTH Resilient Athletic Flooring

Alt 6 - OA Delete Ext Gym Windows

Alt 7 - OA Delete Int Gym Windows

Alt 8a - OA Backfill and Pad w/ Stone

Alt 8b - WC Backfill and Pad w/ Stone

Alt 9 - BOTH Delete 50% Operables

Alt 10 - BOTH Logos on Gym Walls

Alt 11 - BOTH Logos on Gym Floors

Alt 12 - WC Alum Ext Door at C3

Alt 13 - WC Rem/Replace Admin Slab

Alt 14 - OA Increase UV Louver Size

Alt 15a - OA Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 15b - OA Temp Siemens

Alt 15c - OA Temp Carrier

Alt 15d - OA Temp Automated Logic

Alt 15e - OA Temp Honeywell

Alt 15f - OA Temp Belimo

Alt 16a - WC Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 16b - WC Temp Siemens

Alt 16c - WC Temp Carrier

Alt 16d - WC Temp Automated Logic

Alt 16e - WC Temp Honeywell

Alt 16f - WC Temp Belimo




Bid Comparison Form:

Job/Sub Job: Project: Completed By: Date:
J07415.000 2017 Antioch School District 34 Referendum Facility Master Plan Chris Urban 2/13/2018
Bid Package No./Rel. Description of Package:
BPO8A Aluminum Storefront, Windows And Glazing Work Page 1 of 1
Firms Submitting Bids
1 Lake Shore Glass & Mirror Co. 3
2 4
Bid Details 1 2 3 4 6
10 % Bid Bond: X
Supplements 1, 2, 3, 4,5
X
BASE BID $1,150,000
Alternates:
Alt 1 - OA Replace Existing Windows $462,000
Alt 2 - OA Added Site Lighting
Alt 3 - WC Skylights in LRC 145/145A
Alt 4 - WC New Generator
Alt 5 - BOTH Resilient Athletic Flooring
Alt 6 - OA Delete Ext Gym Windows ($45,000)
Alt 7 - OA Delete Int Gym Windows ($9,187)

Alt 8a - OA Backfill and Pad w/ Stone

Alt 8b - WC Backfill and Pad w/ Stone

Alt 9 - BOTH Delete 50% Operables

Alt 10 - BOTH Logos on Gym Walls

Alt 11 - BOTH Logos on Gym Floors

Alt 12 - WC Alum Ext Door at C3

Alt 13 - WC Rem/Replace Admin Slab

Alt 14 - OA Increase UV Louver Size

Alt 15a - OA Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 15b - OA Temp Siemens

Alt 15¢c - OA Temp Carrier

Alt 15d - OA Temp Automated Logic

Alt 15e - OA Temp Honeywell

Alt 15f - OA Temp Belimo

Alt 16a - WC Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 16b - WC Temp Siemens

Alt 16c - WC Temp Carrier

Alt 16d - WC Temp Automated Logic

Alt 16e - WC Temp Honeywell

Alt 16f - WC Temp Belimo




Bid Comparison Form:

Job/Sub Job: Project: Completed By: Date:
J07415.000 2017 Antioch School District 34 Referendum Facility Master Plan Chris Urban 2/13/2018
Bid Package No./Rel. Description of Package:
BP0O9A Metal Stud Framing and Drywall Work Page 1 of 1
Firms Submitting Bids
1 Doherty Construction 3
2 Morfin Construction General Carpentry 4
Bid Details 1 2 3 4 6
10 % Bid Bond: X X
Supplements 1, 2, 3, 4,5
X X
BASE BID $1,521,235 $2,426,000
Alternates:
Alt 1 - OA Replace Existing Windows
Alt 2 - OA Added Site Lighting
Alt 3 - WC Skylights in LRC 145/145A $21,100 $18,000

Alt 4 - WC New Generator

Alt 5 - BOTH Resilient Athletic Flooring

Alt 6 - OA Delete Ext Gym Windows

Alt 7 - OA Delete Int Gym Windows

Alt 8a - OA Backfill and Pad w/ Stone

Alt 8b - WC Backfill and Pad w/ Stone

Alt 9 - BOTH Delete 50% Operables

Alt 10 - BOTH Logos on Gym Walls

Alt 11 - BOTH Logos on Gym Floors

Alt 12 - WC Alum Ext Door at C3

Alt 13 - WC Rem/Replace Admin Slab

Alt 14 - OA Increase UV Louver Size

Alt 15a - OA Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 15b - OA Temp Siemens

Alt 15c - OA Temp Carrier

Alt 15d - OA Temp Automated Logic

Alt 15e - OA Temp Honeywell

Alt 15f - OA Temp Belimo

Alt 16a - WC Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 16b - WC Temp Siemens

Alt 16c - WC Temp Carrier

Alt 16d - WC Temp Automated Logic

Alt 16e - WC Temp Honeywell

Alt 16f - WC Temp Belimo




Bid Comparison Form:

Job/Sub Job: Project: Completed By: Date:
J07415.000 2017 Antioch School District 34 Referendum Facility Master Plan Chris Urban 2/13/2018
Bid Package No./Rel. Description of Package:
BP09B Resilient Flooring and Carpeting Work Page 1 of 1
Firms Submitting Bids
1 Libertyville Tile & Carpet 3 Shamrock Flooring
2 Mr. David's Flooring International 4 Vortex Enterprises
Bid Details 1 2 3 4 6
10 % Bid Bond: X X X X
Supplements 1, 2, 3, 4,5
X X thru 2 X

BASE BID $497,057 $633,785 $501,722 $463,259
Alternates:
Alt 1 - OA Replace Existing Windows
Alt 2 - OA Added Site Lighting
Alt 3 - WC Skylights in LRC 145/145A
Alt 4 - WC New Generator
Alt 5 - BOTH Resilient Athletic Flooring $157,950

Alt 6 - OA Delete Ext Gym Windows

Alt 7 - OA Delete Int Gym Windows

Alt 8a - OA Backfill and Pad w/ Stone

Alt 8b - WC Backfill and Pad w/ Stone

Alt 9 - BOTH Delete 50% Operables

Alt 10 - BOTH Logos on Gym Walls

Alt 11 - BOTH Logos on Gym Floors

Alt 12 - WC Alum Ext Door at C3

Alt 13 - WC Rem/Replace Admin Slab

Alt 14 - OA Increase UV Louver Size

Alt 15a - OA Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 15b - OA Temp Siemens

Alt 15c - OA Temp Carrier

Alt 15d - OA Temp Automated Logic

Alt 15e - OA Temp Honeywell

Alt 15f - OA Temp Belimo

Alt 16a - WC Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 16b - WC Temp Siemens

Alt 16c - WC Temp Carrier

Alt 16d - WC Temp Automated Logic

Alt 16e - WC Temp Honeywell

Alt 16f - WC Temp Belimo




Bid Comparison Form:

Job/Sub Job: Project: Completed By: Date:
J07415.000 2017 Antioch School District 34 Referendum Facility Master Plan Chris Urban 2/13/2018
Bid Package No./Rel. Description of Package:
BP09C Painting Work Page 1 of 1
Firms Submitting Bids
1 Cosgrove Construction 3
2 Oosterbaan & Sons Co. 4
Bid Details 1 2 3 4 6
0, H .
10 % Bid Bond: X X
Supplements 1, 2, 3, 4,5
X X
BASE BID $212,000 $264,500
Alternates:
Alt 1 - OA Replace Existing Windows $5,000 $7,900
Alt 2 - OA Added Site Lighting
Alt 3 - WC Skylights in LRC 145/145A $1,200 $2,500
Alt 4 - WC New Generator
Alt 5 - BOTH Resilient Athletic Flooring
Alt 6 - OA Delete Ext Gym Windows $0
Alt 7 - OA Delete Int Gym Windows
Alt 8a - OA Backfill and Pad w/ Stone
Alt 8b - WC Backfill and Pad w/ Stone
Alt 9 - BOTH Delete 50% Operables
Alt 10 - BOTH Logos on Gym Walls $22,000 $6,900

Alt 11 - BOTH Logos on Gym Floors

Alt 12 - WC Alum Ext Door at C3

Alt 13 - WC Rem/Replace Admin Slab

Alt 14 - OA Increase UV Louver Size

Alt 15a - OA Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 15b - OA Temp Siemens

Alt 15c - OA Temp Carrier

Alt 15d - OA Temp Automated Logic

Alt 15e - OA Temp Honeywell

Alt 15f - OA Temp Belimo

Alt 16a - WC Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 16b - WC Temp Siemens

Alt 16c - WC Temp Carrier

Alt 16d - WC Temp Automated Logic

Alt 16e - WC Temp Honeywell

Alt 16f - WC Temp Belimo




Bid Comparison Form:

Job/Sub Job:
J07415.000

Bid Package No./Rel.
BP09D

Project:

2017 Antioch School District 34 Referendum Facility Master Plan

Description of Package:
Athletic Flooring Work

Completed By:
Chris Urban

Firms Submitting Bids

1 Mr. Davids 3

2 Libertyville Tile & Carpet 4

Date:
2/13/2018

Page 1 of 1

Bid Details

10 % Bid Bond:

Supplements 1, 2, 3, 4,5

X

BASE BID

$177,560 $160,340

Alternates:

Alt 1 - OA Replace Existing Windows

Alt 2 - OA Added Site Lighting

Alt 3 - WC Skylights in LRC 145/145A

Alt 4 - WC New Generator

Alt 5 - BOTH Resilient Athletic Flooring

Alt 6 - OA Delete Ext Gym Windows

Alt 7 - OA Delete Int Gym Windows

Alt 8a - OA Backfill and Pad w/ Stone

Alt 8b - WC Backfill and Pad w/ Stone

Alt 9 - BOTH Delete 50% Operables

Alt 10 - BOTH Logos on Gym Walls

Alt 11 - BOTH Logos on Gym Floors

$9,000 $15,000

Alt 12 - WC Alum Ext Door at C3

Alt 13 - WC Rem/Replace Admin Slab

Alt 14 - OA Increase UV Louver Size

Alt 15a - OA Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 15b - OA Temp Siemens

Alt 15c - OA Temp Carrier

Alt 15d - OA Temp Automated Logic

Alt 15e - OA Temp Honeywell

Alt 15f - OA Temp Belimo

Alt 16a - WC Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 16b - WC Temp Siemens

Alt 16c - WC Temp Carrier

Alt 16d - WC Temp Automated Logic

Alt 16e - WC Temp Honeywell

Alt 16f - WC Temp Belimo




Bid Comparison Form:

Job/Sub Job: Project: Completed By: Date:
J07415.000 2017 Antioch School District 34 Referendum Facility Master Plan Chris Urban 2/13/2018
Bid Package No./Rel. Description of Package:
BPO9E Acoustical Ceilings Work Page 1 of 1
Firms Submitting Bids
1 Just Rite Acoustics
2
Bid Details 1 3 4 6
10 % Bid Bond: X
Supplements 1, 2, 3, 4,5
X

BASE BID $322,300
Alternates:

Alt 1 - OA Replace Existing Windows

Alt 2 - OA Added Site Lighting

Alt 3 - WC Skylights in LRC 145/145A

Alt 4 - WC New Generator

Alt 5 - BOTH Resilient Athletic Flooring

Alt 6 - OA Delete Ext Gym Windows

Alt 7 - OA Delete Int Gym Windows

Alt 8a - OA Backfill and Pad w/ Stone

Alt 8b - WC Backfill and Pad w/ Stone

Alt 9 - BOTH Delete 50% Operables

Alt 10 - BOTH Logos on Gym Walls

Alt 11 - BOTH Logos on Gym Floors

Alt 12 - WC Alum Ext Door at C3

Alt 13 - WC Rem/Replace Admin Slab

Alt 14 - OA Increase UV Louver Size

Alt 15a - OA Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 15b - OA Temp Siemens

Alt 15c - OA Temp Carrier

Alt 15d - OA Temp Automated Logic

Alt 15e - OA Temp Honeywell

Alt 15f - OA Temp Belimo

Alt 16a - WC Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 16b - WC Temp Siemens

Alt 16c - WC Temp Carrier

Alt 16d - WC Temp Automated Logic

Alt 16e - WC Temp Honeywell

Alt 16f - WC Temp Belimo




Bid Comparison Form:

Job/Sub Job: Project: Completed By: Date:
J07415.000 2017 Antioch School District 34 Referendum Facility Master Plan Chris Urban 2/13/2018
Bid Package No./Rel. Description of Package:
BPO9F Ceramic Tile Work Page 1 of 1
Firms Submitting Bids
1 Libertyville Tile & Carpet 3
2 4
Bid Details 1 2 3 4 6
10 % Bid Bond: X
Supplements 1, 2, 3, 4,5
X

BASE BID $232,672
Alternates:

Alt 1 - OA Replace Existing Windows

Alt 2 - OA Added Site Lighting

Alt 3 - WC Skylights in LRC 145/145A

Alt 4 - WC New Generator

Alt 5 - BOTH Resilient Athletic Flooring

Alt 6 - OA Delete Ext Gym Windows

Alt 7 - OA Delete Int Gym Windows

Alt 8a - OA Backfill and Pad w/ Stone

Alt 8b - WC Backfill and Pad w/ Stone

Alt 9 - BOTH Delete 50% Operables

Alt 10 - BOTH Logos on Gym Walls

Alt 11 - BOTH Logos on Gym Floors

Alt 12 - WC Alum Ext Door at C3

Alt 13 - WC Rem/Replace Admin Slab

Alt 14 - OA Increase UV Louver Size

Alt 15a - OA Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 15b - OA Temp Siemens

Alt 15c - OA Temp Carrier

Alt 15d - OA Temp Automated Logic

Alt 15e - OA Temp Honeywell

Alt 15f - OA Temp Belimo

Alt 16a - WC Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 16b - WC Temp Siemens

Alt 16c - WC Temp Carrier

Alt 16d - WC Temp Automated Logic

Alt 16e - WC Temp Honeywell

Alt 16f - WC Temp Belimo




Bid Comparison Form:

Job/Sub Job: Project: Completed By: Date:
J07415.000 2017 Antioch School District 34 Referendum Facility Master Plan Chris Urban 2/13/2018
Bid Package No./Rel. Description of Package:
BP21A Fire Protection Work Page 1 of 1
Firms Submitting Bids
1 Absolute Fire Protection 3 United States Fire Protection
2 Nelson Piping Company 4
Bid Details 1 2 3 4 6
10 % Bid Bond: X X X
Supplements 1, 2, 3, 4,5
X X thru 3

BASE BID $366,700 $226,828 $409,800
Alternates:

Alt 1 - OA Replace Existing Windows

Alt 2 - OA Added Site Lighting

Alt 3 - WC Skylights in LRC 145/145A

Alt 4 - WC New Generator

Alt 5 - BOTH Resilient Athletic Flooring

Alt 6 - OA Delete Ext Gym Windows

Alt 7 - OA Delete Int Gym Windows

Alt 8a - OA Backfill and Pad w/ Stone

Alt 8b - WC Backfill and Pad w/ Stone

Alt 9 - BOTH Delete 50% Operables

Alt 10 - BOTH Logos on Gym Walls

Alt 11 - BOTH Logos on Gym Floors

Alt 12 - WC Alum Ext Door at C3

Alt 13 - WC Rem/Replace Admin Slab

Alt 14 - OA Increase UV Louver Size

Alt 15a - OA Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 15b - OA Temp Siemens

Alt 15c - OA Temp Carrier

Alt 15d - OA Temp Automated Logic

Alt 15e - OA Temp Honeywell

Alt 15f - OA Temp Belimo

Alt 16a - WC Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 16b - WC Temp Siemens

Alt 16c - WC Temp Carrier

Alt 16d - WC Temp Automated Logic

Alt 16e - WC Temp Honeywell

Alt 16f - WC Temp Belimo




Bid Comparison Form:

Job/Sub Job: Project: Completed By: Date:
J07415.000 2017 Antioch School District 34 Referendum Facility Master Plan Chris Urban 2/13/2018
Bid Package No./Rel. Description of Package:
BP22A Plumbing Work Page 1 of 1
Firms Submitting Bids
1 DeFranco Plumbing 3
2 Sheridan Plumbing & Sewer 4
Bid Details 1 2 3 4 6
10 % Bid Bond: X X
Supplements 1, 2, 3, 4,5
X X

BASE BID $1,109,278 $1,052,605
Alternates:

Alt 1 - OA Replace Existing Windows

Alt 2 - OA Added Site Lighting

Alt 3 - WC Skylights in LRC 145/145A

Alt 4 - WC New Generator

Alt 5 - BOTH Resilient Athletic Flooring

Alt 6 - OA Delete Ext Gym Windows

Alt 7 - OA Delete Int Gym Windows

Alt 8a - OA Backfill and Pad w/ Stone

Alt 8b - WC Backfill and Pad w/ Stone

Alt 9 - BOTH Delete 50% Operables

Alt 10 - BOTH Logos on Gym Walls

Alt 11 - BOTH Logos on Gym Floors

Alt 12 - WC Alum Ext Door at C3

Alt 13 - WC Rem/Replace Admin Slab

Alt 14 - OA Increase UV Louver Size

Alt 15a - OA Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 15b - OA Temp Siemens

Alt 15c - OA Temp Carrier

Alt 15d - OA Temp Automated Logic

Alt 15e - OA Temp Honeywell

Alt 15f - OA Temp Belimo

Alt 16a - WC Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 16b - WC Temp Siemens

Alt 16c - WC Temp Carrier

Alt 16d - WC Temp Automated Logic

Alt 16e - WC Temp Honeywell

Alt 16f - WC Temp Belimo




Bid Comparison Form:

Job/Sub Job:
J07415.000

Bid Package No./Rel.
BP23A

Project:

2017 Antioch School District 34 Referendum Facility Master Plan

Description of Package:

HVAC & Temperature Controls Work - Oakland

Completed By:
Chris Urban

Firms Submitting Bids

1 Amber Mechanical Contractors

2 FE Moran

Ideal Heating Company

Martin Petersen Company

Date:
2/13/2018

Page 1 of 1

Bid Details

10 % Bid Bond:

Supplements 1, 2, 3, 4,5

X

X

X

X

BASE BID

$2,091,395

$1,542,000

$1,777,000

$1,835,750

Alternates:

Alt 1 - OA Replace Existing Windows

Alt 2 - OA Added Site Lighting

Alt 3 - WC Skylights in LRC 145/145A

Alt 4 - WC New Generator

Alt 5 - BOTH Resilient Athletic Flooring

Alt 6 - OA Delete Ext Gym Windows

Alt 7 - OA Delete Int Gym Windows

Alt 8a - OA Backfill and Pad w/ Stone

Alt 8b - WC Backfill and Pad w/ Stone

Alt 9 - BOTH Delete 50% Operables

Alt 10 - BOTH Logos on Gym Walls

Alt 11 - BOTH Logos on Gym Floors

Alt 12 - WC Alum Ext Door at C3

Alt 13 - WC Rem/Replace Admin Slab

Alt 14 - OA Increase UV Louver Size

$8,400

$0

Alt 15a - OA Temp Johnson Controls

$250,000

$252,500

$255,000

$250,000

Alt 15b - OA Temp Siemens

$216,000

$216,500

$236,500

$216,000

Alt 15c - OA Temp Carrier

no bid

$324,500

$353,000

$321,230

Alt 15d - OA Temp Automated Logic

no bid

no bid

Alt 15e - OA Temp Honeywell

no bid

$216,500

Alt 15f - OA Temp Belimo

no bid

no bid

Alt 16a - WC Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 16b - WC Temp Siemens

Alt 16c - WC Temp Carrier

Alt 16d - WC Temp Automated Logic

Alt 16e - WC Temp Honeywell

Alt 16f - WC Temp Belimo




Bid Comparison Form:

Job/Sub Job: Project:
J07415.000

2017 Antioch School District 34 Referendum Facility Master Plan

Bid Package No./Rel. Description of Package:

BP23B HVAC & Temperature Controls Work - W.C. Petty

Completed By:
Chris Urban

Date:
2/13/2018

Firms Submitting Bids

1 Amber Mechanical Contractors

2 Edwards Engineering

3 FE Moran

4 Ideal Heating Company

Page 1 of 1

Martin Petersen Company

Bid Details 1

10 % Bid Bond:

Supplements 1, 2, 3, 4,5
X

X X

X

X

BASE BID $900,000

$644,984

$639,200

$642,000

$635,750

Alternates:

Alt 1 - OA Replace Existing Windows

Alt 2 - OA Added Site Lighting

Alt 3 - WC Skylights in LRC 145/145A

Alt 4 - WC New Generator

Alt 5 - BOTH Resilient Athletic Flooring

Alt 6 - OA Delete Ext Gym Windows

Alt 7 - OA Delete Int Gym Windows

Alt 8a - OA Backfill and Pad w/ Stone

Alt 8b - WC Backfill and Pad w/ Stone

Alt 9 - BOTH Delete 50% Operables

Alt 10 - BOTH Logos on Gym Walls

Alt 11 - BOTH Logos on Gym Floors

Alt 12 - WC Alum Ext Door at C3

Alt 13 - WC Rem/Replace Admin Slab

Alt 14 - OA Increase UV Louver Size

Alt 15a - OA Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 15b - OA Temp Siemens

Alt 15c - OA Temp Carrier

Alt 15d - OA Temp Automated Logic

Alt 15e - OA Temp Honeywell

Alt 15f - OA Temp Belimo

Alt 16a - WC Temp Johnson Controls $243,500

$280,025 $246,000

$267,900

$243,500

Alt 16b - WC Temp Siemens $205,000

$230,000 $202,000

$225,500

$205,000

Alt 16c - WC Temp Carrier $205,000

$320,577 $247,000

$269,000

$278,745

Alt 16d - WC Temp Automated Logic no bid

no bid no bid

no bid

no bid

Alt 16e - WC Temp Honeywell no bid

no bid $230,000

no bid

no bid

Alt 16f - WC Temp Belimo no bid

no bid no bid

no bid

no bid




Bid Comparison Form:

Job/Sub Job:
J07415.000

Bid Package No./Rel.
BP31A

Project:

2017 Antioch School District 34 Referendum Facility Master Plan

Description of Package:

Earthwork and Site Utilities Work

Completed By:
Chris Urban

Firms Submitting Bids

1 Berger Excavating

3 Joseph J Henderson

DK Contractors

Lenny Hoffman Excavating

Date:
2/13/2018

Page 1 of 1

Bid Details

10 % Bid Bond:

Supplements 1, 2, 3, 4,5

X

X

X

X

BASE BID

$2,088,000

$1,500,000

$2,029,000

$2,296,094

Alternates:

Alt 1 - OA Replace Existing Windows

Alt 2 - OA Added Site Lighting

Alt 3 - WC Skylights in LRC 145/145A

Alt 4 - WC New Generator

Alt 5 - BOTH Resilient Athletic Flooring

Alt 6 - OA Delete Ext Gym Windows

Alt 7 - OA Delete Int Gym Windows

Alt 8a - OA Backfill and Pad w/ Stone

$175,000

$29,445

$54,600

$38,000

Alt 8b - WC Backfill and Pad w/ Stone

$50,000

$15,080

$24,400

$27,000

Alt 9 - BOTH Delete 50% Operables

Alt 10 - BOTH Logos on Gym Walls

Alt 11 - BOTH Logos on Gym Floors

Alt 12 - WC Alum Ext Door at C3

Alt 13 - WC Rem/Replace Admin Slab

$3,500

$1,235

$3,000

$5,900

Alt 14 - OA Increase UV Louver Size

Alt 15a - OA Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 15b - OA Temp Siemens

Alt 15c - OA Temp Carrier

Alt 15d - OA Temp Automated Logic

Alt 15e - OA Temp Honeywell

Alt 15f - OA Temp Belimo

Alt 16a - WC Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 16b - WC Temp Siemens

Alt 16c - WC Temp Carrier

Alt 16d - WC Temp Automated Logic

Alt 16e - WC Temp Honeywell

Alt 16f - WC Temp Belimo




Bid Comparison Form:

Job/Sub Job:
J07415.000

Bid Package No./Rel.

Project: Completed By:
2017 Antioch School District 34 Referendum Facility Master Plan Chris Urban

Date:
2/13/2018

Description of Package:

BP32A Asphalt and Concrete Paving Page 1 of 1
Firms Submitting Bids
1 Abbey Paving & Sealcoating Co. 3 Chicagoland Paving Contractors Payne & Dolan
2 Allstar Asphalt 4 Mertes Contracting Corporation DBA Accu-Paving Schroeder Asphalt Services
Bid Details 1 2 3 4 5 6
10 % Bid Bond: X X X X X
Supplements 1, 2, 3, 4,5
X X X X X X
BASE BID $528,900 $559,500 $433,900 $587,055 $666,198 $487,848
Alternates:

Alt 1 - OA Replace Existing Windows

Alt 2 - OA Added Site Lighting

Alt 3 - WC Skylights in LRC 145/145A

Alt 4 - WC New Generator

Alt 5 - BOTH Resilient Athletic Flooring

Alt 6 - OA Delete Ext Gym Windows

Alt 7 - OA Delete Int Gym Windows

Alt 8a - OA Backfill and Pad w/ Stone

Alt 8b - WC Backfill and Pad w/ Stone

Alt 9 - BOTH Delete 50% Operables

Alt 10 - BOTH Logos on Gym Walls

Alt 11 - BOTH Logos on Gym Floors

Alt 12 - WC Alum Ext Door at C3

Alt 13 - WC Rem/Replace Admin Slab

Alt 14 - OA Increase UV Louver Size

Alt 15a - OA Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 15b - OA Temp Siemens

Alt 15c - OA Temp Carrier

Alt 15d - OA Temp Automated Logic

Alt 15e - OA Temp Honeywell

Alt 15f - OA Temp Belimo

Alt 16a - WC Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 16b - WC Temp Siemens

Alt 16c - WC Temp Carrier

Alt 16d - WC Temp Automated Logic

Alt 16e - WC Temp Honeywell

Alt 16f - WC Temp Belimo




Bid Comparison Form:

Job/Sub Job: Project: Completed By: Date:
J07415.000 2017 Antioch School District 34 Referendum Facility Master Plan Chris Urban 2/13/2018
Bid Package No./Rel. Description of Package:
BP33A Landscaping and Site Furnishing Work Page 1 of 1
Firms Submitting Bids
1 Breezy Hill Nursery
2
Bid Details 1 3 4 6
10 % Bid Bond: X
Supplements 1, 2, 3, 4,5
X

BASE BID $345,200
Alternates:

Alt 1 - OA Replace Existing Windows

Alt 2 - OA Added Site Lighting

Alt 3 - WC Skylights in LRC 145/145A

Alt 4 - WC New Generator

Alt 5 - BOTH Resilient Athletic Flooring

Alt 6 - OA Delete Ext Gym Windows

Alt 7 - OA Delete Int Gym Windows

Alt 8a - OA Backfill and Pad w/ Stone

Alt 8b - WC Backfill and Pad w/ Stone

Alt 9 - BOTH Delete 50% Operables

Alt 10 - BOTH Logos on Gym Walls

Alt 11 - BOTH Logos on Gym Floors

Alt 12 - WC Alum Ext Door at C3

Alt 13 - WC Rem/Replace Admin Slab

Alt 14 - OA Increase UV Louver Size

Alt 15a - OA Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 15b - OA Temp Siemens

Alt 15c - OA Temp Carrier

Alt 15d - OA Temp Automated Logic

Alt 15e - OA Temp Honeywell

Alt 15f - OA Temp Belimo

Alt 16a - WC Temp Johnson Controls

Alt 16b - WC Temp Siemens

Alt 16c - WC Temp Carrier

Alt 16d - WC Temp Automated Logic

Alt 16e - WC Temp Honeywell

Alt 16f - WC Temp Belimo




